
            

                                                                  

 Monday, 12th Tuesday, 13th Wednesday, 14th Thursday,15th Friday, 16th 

Souper 
Soup Loaded Potato Cream of 

Mushroom Tomato Florentine Squash Medley French Onion 

Downtown 
Deli 

  BCT 
Crispy bacon, Cheddar 
cheese and fresh sliced 

tomato all on wheat 
bread 

Roast Beef & 
Cheddar 

Thinly sliced roast beef 
with cheddar cheese, 

tomato and lettuce on a 
brioche bun.  

  

California Turkey 
Wrap 

Roasted tomato wrap with 
turkey, cheddar, tomato, 
lettuce and guacamole 

spread 

  Orchard Club 
 

Sliced apples, oven 
roasted turkey, cream 

cheese spread with 
chopped bacon on potato 

bread   

Italian Hoagie 
 

Large Italian bread with 
layers of ham, cappicola, 

salami and provolone 
cheese, shredded lettuce, 

tomatoes, onions and 
banana peppers    

Chef’s 
Choice 

& 
Sides 

Grilled Chicken 
Parmesan 

Grilled chicken breast 
covered in our red sauce 
and a slice of Provolone 
cheese and baked in the 

oven 

Chicken And 
Waffle 

Breaded Chicken oven 
baked and served over 

waffles with maple syrup 
over top of them Garnished 
with scallions Served with 

Cole slaw 

Mushroom Blend 
Bolognese 

Cremini and Portabella 
mushrooms with ground 
sirloin in our Marinara 

sauce over linguini 

Blackened Tilapia 
A whole tilapia filet 

sprinkled with blackening 
seasoning and baked in 
the oven. Served with 
brown rice and fresh 

vegetable   

Philly 
Cheesesteak 

Thinly sliced ribeye steak 
with your choice of 
sautéed onions and 

mushrooms and 
American cheese served 

on a hoagie roll   

Vegetarian 

Caprese Salad 
 

Thick cut vine ripened 
tomatoes , fresh 

mozzarella and fresh 
basil drizzled with olive 
oil and aged Balsamic 

Vinegar 

 Noodle Mushroom 
Bowl 

Chewy Lo-Mein noodles 
with local mushroom blend 
in veggie stock with sesame 

and cilantro 

Pierogies 
Pasta shells filled with 
mashed potatoes and 
cheese and tossed in a 

light butter sauce   

 Roasted Spaghetti 
Squash 

Spaghetti squash roasted 
with mushrooms, 

tomatoes and fresh basil 
w/ balsamic glaze 

Southwest Black 
Bean Omelet 

Black beans, cheddar 
cheese and Pico de Gallo, 
all wrapped up in a light, 

fluffy omelet shell 

Pizza 
Villaggio Pepperoni Chorizo Ham  Tomato & Fresh 

Mozz BBQ Chicken 

Farmhouse 
Special 

Ham & Cheese on 
Pretzel 

Turkey & Swiss on 
Brioche 

Grilled Chicken on 
Focaccia 

BBQ Chicken, 
Bacon and 
Cheddar  

Chipotle Beef and 
Cheddar on 

Focaccia 
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